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Anne-Sophie Bricca is Deputy General Counsel at Terumo BCT, a 
global leader in blood components and cellular technologies, 
member of the Terumo group. With her team, she provides legal 
and compliance support to Terumo BCT sales entities in EMEA. She 
is a member of Terumo BCT Executive Leadership Team. She 
represents Terumo group at MedTech Europe (the European 
association of the medical devices and diagnostic industry) and 
since January 2019, she assumes the Chair of the Ethics and 
Compliance Group and seats at the Code Committee. She is also 
the General Secretary of ETHICS (International Society of 
Healthcare Ethics and Compliance). 
Before joining Terumo BCT in 2009, Anne-Sophie Bricca worked as 
in-house counsel for the IT industry during 10 years (HP, CPG 
International, Ingram Micro). She also worked as a general counsel 
for Franco Dragone Entertainment Group for the design and 
making of the Macao show “The House of Dancing Water”. 
Anne-Sophie holds two post graduates degrees in European Laws 
from the University Robert Schuman (Strasbourg) and in 
International Laws from the Université Libre de Bruxelles 
(Brussels). She was the laureate of the international Rousseau 
Competition in International Laws chaired by Boutros Boutros-
Ghali in 1997. 
  

 


